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Today's cockpits integrate cutting-
edge technology, but they owe much 
to early aviation pioneers. This article 
explores how past innovations shape 
modern flight decks.

Read here

Bell 407 
Maintenance 

Oversight

A massive fire at a train repair hall 
ignited thousands of lithium-ion 
batteries, causing explosions and a 
toxic smoke cloud over the city.

Lithium Inferno 
in Gdańsk

Read here

A Bell 407 helicopter experienced a 
power loss due to a worn throttle 
detent, emphasizing the need for 
thorough maintenance checks. 

Read here

An EC120 helicopter suffered engine 
power loss after maintenance 
introduced foreign object debris. 

Read here

EC120 Engine 
Power Loss

https://aviationweek.com/business-aviation/safety-ops-regulation/modern-cockpits-rest-pioneers-shoulders-part-2
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=rv_3w1Po3W8
https://aerossurance.com/air-accidents-incidents/b407-worn-throttle-detent-power-loss/
https://aerossurance.com/air-accidents-incidents/engine-maintenance-introduced-fod-that-caused-an-ec120-power-loss/
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Maintenance errors, including 
improper rod end replacements, led to 
a fatal Robinson R44 helicopter crash, 
underscoring the criticality of adhering 
to service guidelines. 

Read here

Maintenance 
Error Fatalities

The 'Dirty Dozen' highlights common 
human error factors in aircraft 
maintenance, aiming to improve 
safety standards. 

'Dirty Dozen' in 
Maintenance

Read here

A botched avionics installation 
caused engine failure, resulting in a 
tragic crash

Read here

Incorrectly wired anti-skid sensors led to 
a fatal runway overrun in Alaska, 
highlighting critical maintenance errors. 

Read here

PenAir Runway 
Overrun

https://www.ainonline.com/aviation-news/business-aviation/2024-05-06/r44-crash-final-report-cites-maintenance-errors
https://www.safety.af.mil/News/Article-Display/Article/3474731/the-dirty-dozen-common-human-error-factors-in-aircraft-maintenance-mishaps/
https://generalaviationnews.com/2024/06/28/maintenance-error-proves-fatal-for-two/
https://www.ntsb.gov/news/press-releases/Pages/mr20211102b.aspx
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